
OFFICIAL 

OFFICIAL 

Between the dates of 07/11/23 and 16/01/24, the number of Incidents and Crime Reports 
respectively are 275 and 80 

There have been 5 crime reports 
raised in regards to possession of 
drugs. All 5 reports are detected and 
have led to either Recorded Police 
Warnings being issued or reports 
being submitted to the Procurator 
Fiscal.   

Community Council Debrief 

Dates Between: 07/11/23 – 16/01/24 

Location & Beat: Bute – LB53/54 

Reporting Officer: PS Scott Thain 
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There have been 8 reports raised for 
incidents of theft. 6 of these are 
currently ongoing enquiries and 2 
have been detected.  
 
There has been 1 report raised in 
regards to fraud which is currently 
ongoing.  
 
There have been 2 reports raised in 
regards to Reset, both of which are 
detected.  

  
There has been 1 report raised in 
respect of dangerous driving which 
has been detected.  
 
There have been 3 reports raised in 
respect of careless driving, 1 of 
which is detected while the other 2 
are ongoing enquiries.  
 
There have been 3 reports raised in 
respect of failing to stop/report a 
road traffic collision, these are all 
ongoing enquiries.  
 
There have been 7 other reports 
raised in respect of miscellaneous 
traffic offences such as drink driving 
and driving with no insurance. 6 of 
these are detected with only 1 still 
an ongoing enquiry. 
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There have been 7 reports raised in 
respect of assaults. 6 of these have 
been detected with the other being 
an ongoing enquiry.  
 
There have been 4 reports raised in 
respect of police assault/resist 
arrest. All 4 of these are detected.  
 
There have been 3 reports raised in 
respect of persons being in 
possession of offensive weapons, 2 
of which are detected and 1 enquiry 
ongoing.  

  
There have been 8 reports raised in 
respect of vandalism on Bute. 7 of 
these are ongoing enquiries and 1 
has been detected.  
 
There have been 14 reports raised 
in respect of threatening/abusive 
behaviour. 12 of these are detected 
with the remaining enquiries 
ongoing.  
 
There have been 3 reports raised in 
respect of patrons failing to quit or 
refusing to leave licensed premises 
on Bute. All of these are detected.  
 
There have been 2 reports raised in 
regards to communication offences. 
One of these are detected and the 
other is ongoing.  
 
There have been 4 reports raised in 
respect of breaches of bail. 2 of 
these have been detected and the 
other 2 are ongoing.  
 
There have been 2 reports raised in 
respect of dangerous dogs, 1 of 
which is detected and the other 
ongoing.  
 
There have been 2 reports raised in 
respect of culpable and reckless 
conduct, 1 of which is detected and 
the other ongoing.  
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There has been 1 report raised in 
regards to attempting to pervert the 
course of justice which has been 
detected.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Useful Links/Contacts 
 

 
Crimestoppers – Crimestoppers in 
Scotland | Crimestoppers 
(crimestoppers-uk.org) 
 
Distress Brief Intervention - Distress 
Brief Intervention - Connected 
Compassionate Support | DBI.scot 
 
Scottish Partnership against Rural 
Crime - Scottish Partnership Against 
Rural Crime | Scottish Partnership 
Against Rural Crime 
(scottishparc.co.uk) 
 
Women’s Aid - Home - Women's 
Aid (womensaid.org.uk)  
 
Citizens Advice – 08081646000 
 
Trading Standards - 08081646000 
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